
Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

S1 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 3.6L V6 N/A N/A
S1A1 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) $40,526 $40,351
S1A2 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) $47,084 $46,959
S1B Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) $43,325 $43,150
S2 Chyrsler Voyager (gas) 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 3.6L V6 N/A N/A

S2A1 Chyrsler Voyager (gas) $39,330 $39,155
S2A2 Chyrsler Voyager(gas) N/A NA
S2B Chyrsler Voyager (gas) N/A NA
J1 Dodge Hornet 2.0L Turbo N/A N/A 2.0L Turbo N/A N/A

J1A Dodge Hornet $30,921.00 $30,696.00
J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A

J2A Jeep Grand Cherokee No Bid No Bid $35,102.00 NA
J2B Jeep Grand Cherokee No Bid No Bid $36,957.00 NA
J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A

J2C Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) No Bid N/A $37,057.00 NA
J2D Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) No Bid N/A $38,837.00 NA
J6 Jeep Wrangler 2.0L Turbo 3.0L Diesel 3.6L V6 2.0L Turbo 3.0L Diesel 3.6L V6

J6A Jeep Wrangler N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA

J6B Jeep Wrangler $33,847 N/A $31,672 $33,919 NA $32,735

Total: $266,705.00 $266,965.00

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or 
that may have not been released at the time of this 

bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF 

CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5%

Awarded Bid Tab
Stellantis

Sedans, SUVs, Vans
Gregg Young Stellantis Gene Steffy Stellantis

5%



Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
R1 RAM 1500 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6

R1A RAM 1500 $38,363.00 N/A $35,964.00 $38,188.00 NA $35,789.00
R1B RAM 1500 $39,823.00 N/A $37,424.00 $39,648.00 NA $37,249.00
R1 RAM 1500 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6

R1C RAM 1500 $39,397.00 N/A $36,998.00 $39,222.00 NA $36,823.00
R1D RAM 1500 $42,448.00 N/A $40,049.00 $42,273.00 NA $39,874.00
R1 RAM 1500 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6

R1E RAM 1500 $39,394.00 N/A N/A $39,219.00 NA NA
R1F RAM 1500 $42,943.00 N/A N/A $42,768.00 NA NA
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel

R2A RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $38,580.00 $47,479.00
R2B RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $41,282.00 $50,181.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8

R2C RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $41,076.00 $49,976.00
R2D RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $43,779.00 $52,678.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel

R2E RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $41,261.00 $50,160.00
R2F RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid $43,962.00 $52,862.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel

R2G RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid NA NA
R2H RAM 2500 No Bid No Bid NA NA
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO

R3A RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49,501.00 $48,400.00 $50,942.00
R3B RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42,107.00 $51,006.00 $53,548.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO

R3E RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42,944.00 $51,843.00 $54,385.00
R3F RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,648.00 $54,548.00 $57,090.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO
R3I RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43,128.00 $52,028.00 $54,570
R3J RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,833.00 $54,733.00 $57,275.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo 6.7L Diesel HO

R3M RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA
R3N RAM 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA

Total: $392,803.00 $391,053.00

Gene Steffy

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or 
that may have not been released at the time of this 

bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF 

CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

5%

Gregg Young Stellantis
Awarded Bid Tab

Stellantis
Light & Heavy Duty Trucks

5%



Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

SP1 Jeep Wagoneer Hurricane Twin Turbo Hurricane Twin Turbo
SP1A Jeep Wagoneer L No Bid NA
SP2 Dodge Durango Pursuit 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 3.6L V6 5.7L V8

SP2A Dodge Durango Pursuit $39,871 $43,229 $39,556 $42,374
SP3 Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L I6 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6

SP3A Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA
SP3B Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA
SP3 Dodge Ram Heavy Duty Special Service 6.4L Hemi 6.4L (Diesel) 6.4 L High Ooutput (Diesel) 6.4L Hemi 6.7L (DIESEL) 6.4 L High Ooutput (Diesel)

SP3A Dodge Ram Heavy Duty Special Service No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA
SP3B Dodge Ram Heavy Duty Special Service No Bid No Bid No Bid $44,231 $53,436.00 NA
SP3A Dodge Ram Heavy Duty Special Service No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA

5%

Total: $83,100 $81,930

Gene Steffy

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional 
Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have not been 

released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT 

MANUFACTURER MSRP

5%

Awarded Bid Tab
Stellantis

Emergency Services
Gregg Young Stellantis
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